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Solid leadership is the foundation to any successful unit.  It takes well trained leaders to foster unit 
growth, mentor Scouts, and provide a positive Scouting experience for everyone involved.  To be 
successful, a leader must continually find ways to improve themselves through on-going and frequent 
training.  Through education, leaders are able to increase their ability to make Scouting fun with a 
purpose.  Scouting is about the Scouts.  And better trained leaders learn all they can to make it a rich and 
worthwhile experience. 

Every Scout deserves a trained leader. 

Vision:  To improve the quality of the program delivered to Scouts and increase the overall Scouting 
experience through encouraging leaders to view training as a continual and on-going exercise by way of 
recognition. 

“Success in training the boy depends largely on the Scoutmaster’s own personal example.” – 
BP 

Through the Super Trained and Super Trainer awards, leaders will be recognized for their outstanding 
efforts at self-improvement resulting in stronger leadership and units.  Additionally, the awards will be 
used through “positive peer-pressure” for untrained leaders to become fully trained, and eventually 
Super Trained. 

Better trained leaders make better leaders. 

The Super Trainer designation recognizes those few leaders that have gone above and beyond to ensure 
that as many leaders as possible are equipped to best lead Scouts in their respective units. 

“The most important object in Boy Scout training is to educate, not instruct.” – BP 

Each unit type has requirements and electives appropriate for their respective position.  The first 
awarding of the honor is signified by the Super Trained and/or Super Trainer patch to be worn on the 
bottom of the right pocket, with the appropriate device bearing the unit type symbol to be placed on the 
patch. 

The following worksheets list the requirements and electives required for each unit type.  Upon 
completion, the form is to be submitted for approval to your District Training Chair at which time it will 
be reviewed.  The patch and certificate will be awarded at the next District Roundtable.  The public 
recognition and awarding of the Super Trained and Super Trainer patch will serve as encouragement for 
other leaders to achieve the award.
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Complete the following requirements and submit to your District Training Chair. 

Name:  District:  Unit:  

District Training Chair:  
 

   Required 
 Date:  Youth Protection Training (current) 

 

 Date:  Leader Specific Training 
 

 Date:  Hazardous Weather Training (current) 
 

 Date:  Serve one year as a Cub Leader 
 

   Choose one additional class 
 Date:  BALOO 

 

 Date:  Cub Scout Range Master 
 

 Date:  University of Scouting (within last two years) 
 

 Date:  Wood Badge 
 

   Roundtable (four within the last year) 
 Date:   

 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
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Complete the following requirements and submit to your District Training Chair. 

Name:  District:  Unit:  

District Training Chair:  
 

   Required 
 Date:  Youth Protection Training (current) 

 

 Date:  Leader Specific Training 
 

 Date:  Hazardous Weather Training (current) 
 

 Date:  Serve one year as a Scouts BSA Leader 
 

   Choose one additional class 
 Date:  University of Scouting (within the last two years) 

 

 Date:  Wood Badge 
 

 Date:  Powder Horn 
 

 Date:  Wilderness First Aid (current) 
 

   Choose two additional classes 
 Date:  Safe Swim Defense (current) 

 

 Date:  Safety Afloat (current) 
 

 Date:  Climb on Safely (current) 
 

 Date:  Drive Safely 
 

   Roundtable (four within the last year) 
 Date:   

 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
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Complete the following requirements and submit to your District Training Chair. 

Name:  District:  Unit:  

District Training Chair:  
 

   Required 
 Date:  Youth Protection Training (current) 

 

 Date:  Leader Specific Training 
 

 Date:  Hazardous Weather Training (current) 
 

 Date:  Serve one year as a Venture or Sea Scout Leader 
 

   Choose one additional class 
 Date:  University of Scouting (within the last two years) 

 

 Date:  Wood Badge 
 

 Date:  Powder Horn 
 

 Date:  Wilderness First Aid (current) 
 

   Choose two additional classes 
 Date:  Safe Swim Defense (current) 

 

 Date:  Safety Afloat (current) 
 

 Date:  Climb on Safely (current) 
 

 Date:  Drive Safely 
 

   Roundtable (four within the last year) 
 Date:   

 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
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Complete the following requirements and submit to your District Training Chair. 
 

Name:  District:  Unit:  

District Training Chair:  
 

   Required 
 Date:  Super Trained 

 

 Date:  Fundamentals of Training 
 

 Date:  Trainer’s EDGE 
 

 Date:  Member of District or Council Training Staff 
 

   Conduct two live training sessions 
 Date:   

 

 Date:   
 
 

   Roundtable (four within the last year) 
 Date:   

 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
 

 Date:   
 


